

MINDY WOOLDRIDGE
DEPUTY ASSESSOR

CONNIE MAHURIN, DIRECTOR
REAL ESTATE DEPT.



VICKI KELLER, DIRECTOR
PERSONAL PROPERTY DEPT.

JANE RASNIC
FIELD APPRAISER SUPERVISOR

DAN WARD

ASSESSOR OF ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY
1 WEST LIBERTY OFFICE 200
FARMINGTON, MISSOURI 63640
(573) 756-1878
FAX No. (573) 756-5687
E-MAIL: assessor@sfcgov.org
WEBSITE: www.sfcgov.org

TO: Kevin Engler, County Clerk
FROM: Dan Ward, Assessor
DATE: January 12, 2021
SUBJECT: Annual Bid

*M.A.O.S.
Jamie Gamman*

The following is a list of supplies requested to be included in the 2021 annual bid for the Assessor's Office:

ITEMS COST	AMOUNT	TOTAL
Post It Notes, 1 7/8" x 1 7/8" (Plain, Yellow) MMM-622-10SSCY	5 bxs. of 10 ea.	<u>5.64 PK</u>
Post It Notes, 3 x 3 (Plain, Yellow) MMM-654-YW	10 bxs. of 12 ea.	<u>11.66 PK</u>
Post It Notes, 4 x 6 (Plain, Yellow) MMM-659-YW	5 bxs of 12 ea.	<u>24.61 PK</u>
Uniball Signo 207 (Red) Ink Pens UBC-33952	4 bxs. of 12 ea.	<u>10.81 DZ</u>
Uniball Signo 207 (Black) Ink Pens UBC-33590	4 bxs. of 12 ea.	<u>10.86 DZ</u>
Papermate Flexgrip Ultra (Med Blue) Ink Pens PAP-9610131	1 bx. of 12 ea.	<u>11.22 DZ</u>
Sharpie Fine tip Permanent Marker SAN-30001 Black	1 bx. of 12 ea.	<u>8.24 DZ</u>
Bic Intensity Pro Permanent Marker Pro Bullet Tip Bic-PMIPK11BK	1 pkg. of 12 ea.	<u>15.61 DZ</u>

Rubber Bands #33 UNV 00133	2 (1 lb) Bags	<u>3.99 PK</u>
Sort Kwik Lee-10132	1 pkg. of 2 ea.	<u>4.05 PK</u>
Binder Clips (Med) UNV-10210VP Black	2 pkg. 36 ea.	<u>1.85 PK</u>
Correction Tape Mono Hybrid TOM-68721 Side-Action Applicator	1 pkg. 10 ea.	<u>14.50 PK</u>
Air Duster II Power Duster PDC-105870	1 pkg. 6 ea.	<u>27.91 PK</u>
Clorox Disinfecting Wipes RAC-89346CT Crisp Linen Scent RAC 99716CT flat packs lemon/lime (6pk/ct)	2 pkgs. 6 ea.	<u>29.17 ct</u>
Rhodia Classic Bound Graph Paper 5 x 5 80 Sheets per pad	12 ea.	<u>11.49 ea</u>
Important Message Pads – Universal Pink Pads UNV-48023	1 doz. Pads	<u>1.86 DZ</u>
Calendar Refill – Jan – Dec 6 x 6 2022 AAG-K1-50	1 ea.	<u>NO BID</u>
Tape Measure - Ace 100 ft. ½ Width Crank Style	4 ea.	<u>NO BID</u>
Tape Measure – Fat Max 25 ft. SQN 33730 30 ft	4 ea.	<u>32.17 ea</u>
Gel Crystals Wrist Support Mouse Pad FEL-9112101	2 ea.	<u>12.84 ea</u>
Logitech M310 Wireless Mouse LOG-910001675	4 ea.	<u>31.19 ea</u>
Mobil Power Inverter 150W with Input Voltage 12V DC Output Voltage 12V AC Continuous Power 150W	3 ea.	<u>NO BID</u>
Microsoft 65 W Power Supply Adapter for Surface Pro 4 85" Cord Black	3 ea.	<u>NO BID</u>
Lorell Executive Mid Back Work Chair Mesh Back – Fabric Seat AIE EL 42BME10B	9 ea. see attached	<u>135.00 ea</u>
Crio Big & Tall Mid-Back Task Chair (Black) BSX-VL585ES10T	1 ea.	<u>312.00 ea</u>

Board of Equalization Window Envelopes	38 bxs. at 500 ea.	_____
Assessor Affidavit – Non-Assessment	5,000 ea.	_____
Eric Dugal Letterhead	500 ea.	_____
Eric Dugal Envelopes (Blue Ink & Raised Print)	500 ea.	_____
Eric Dugal Window Envelopes	5 bxs. at 500 ea.	_____
Eric Dugal Envelopes (Black Print)	5 bxs. at 500 ea.	_____
ICX Paper, Wide Format, 36 x 3	2 Rolls	<u>45.52RL</u>

ICX 90750219

HP 57 Tri Color (For HP Office Jet 4215)	2 ea.	_____
HP 35A Toner (For HP LaserJet P1006)	1 ea.	_____
Konica Minolta Toner TN513 A33K031	1 ea.	_____
Cannon Ink for Plotter:		
CNM PFI-320 MBK	2 ea.	_____
CNM PFI-320 BK	2 ea.	_____
CNM PFI-320 C	2 ea.	_____
CNM PFI-320 M	2 ea.	_____
CNM PFI-320 Y	2 ea.	_____

Total Bid Amount: _____

Company Name _____

Contact Person _____

Address _____

Telephone _____



Alera Elusion Series Mesh Mid-Back Swivel/Tilt Chair, Supports up to 275 lbs, Black Seat/Black Back, Black Base

ALEEL42BME10B

- Ergonomic design adjusts to fit multiple users.
- Cool, breathable mesh back.
- Contoured seat cushion with waterfall edge to help relieve pressure on legs.
- Height- and width-adjustable arms with soft polyurethane pads.
- Five-star base with casters for easy mobility.
- Height adjustable ratchet back for optimal lumbar support.

List price*

~~394.41~~ /EA

1

ADD TO LIST

Choose other options:

Select a Product



Description :

Ergonomic design adjusts to fit multiple users. Cool, breathable mesh back. Contoured seat cushion with waterfall edge to help relieve pressure on legs. Height- and width-adjustable arms with soft polyurethane pads. Five-star base with casters for easy mobility.

Product Details**

Global Product Type	Chairs/Stools-Office Chairs
Arms Included	Yes
Color Family	Black
Form Style	Padded Slant T-Bar
Seat Material	Mesh
Recommended Applications	General Office & Task
Seat Color	Black
Back Color	Black
Back Height Adjustment	Yes
Pneumatic Seat Height Adjustment	Yes
Seat Glide Mechanism	No
Tilt Tension/Tilt Lock	Yes
Recline Tilt	No
Synchronized Knee Tilt	No
Dual-Action Tilt	No
Posture Lock	No
Multi-Task Control	No
Synchronous Control	No
Dual-Clutch Posture Control	No
Variable Synchro-Tilt	No
Integral Lumbar Support	No
Form Options	Height Adjustable,Width Adjustable
Armrest Color	Black
Armrest Material	Polypropylene,Polyurethane
Distance Between Arms	16.1" to 18"

Arm Height From Seat	6.75" to 9.25"
Overall Width Minimum	24"
Overall Width Maximum	27.76"
Overall Depth Maximum	27"
Overall Height Minimum	37.7"
Overall Height Maximum	44"
Seat Width Maximum	19.6"
Seat Depth Maximum	18.7"
Seat Height Minimum	17.9"
Seat Height Maximum	21.8"
Back Width Maximum	15.2"
Back Height Minimum	22.24"
Back Height Maximum	24.8"
Back Material	Mesh
Base Color	Black
Base Material	Nylon
Caster/Glide/Wheel	Five 2" Hooded Dual-Wheel Casters
Weight Capacity (text)	Supports up to 275 lbs.
Wheel Tread	Hard
Compliance Standards	Meets or Exceeds ANSI/BIFMA Standards
Pre-Consumer Recycled Content Percent	0%
Post-Consumer Recycled Content Percent	0%
Total Recycled Content Percent	0%
Disclaimer Statement	Casters supplied with this chair are not suitable for all floor types.
Seat Material Family	Mesh
Back Material Family	Mesh
Country Of Origin	TW
Gross Weight	51 lbs.
Gross Pack Quantity	1 EA
Back Quantity	0
PC	042167385996
NSPSC	56112102

Shipping Weight & Item Dimensions

Weight	50.71 lbs.
Length	24.4 in
Height	16.1 in
Width	26 in

Warranty

Manufacturer's limited five-year warranty.

So Consider 4 items



HON®

Crio High-Back Task Chair with Asynchronous Control, Supports up to 250 lbs., Black Seat/Black Back, Black Base

BSXVL582SB11T

[Be the first to write a review](#)

M.A.O.S. Printing

Board of Equalization Window Envelopes	38 bxs. at 500 ea. (20,000)	<u>770.00</u>
Assessor Affidavit – Non-Assessment	5,000 ea.	<u>289.00</u>
Eric Dugal Letterhead	500 ea.	<u>145.00</u>
Eric Dugal Envelopes (Blue Ink & Raised Print)	500 ea.	<u>69.00 (Flat Print)</u> <u>NO BID (Raised Print)</u>
Eric Dugal Window Envelopes	5 bxs. at 500 ea.	<u>165.00</u>
Eric Dugal Envelopes (Black Print)	5 bxs. at 500 ea.	<u>142.00</u>
ICX Paper, Wide Format, 36 x 3	2 Rolls	<u> </u>

Quote # T2332
Date 2/12/2021



Quotation

Customer:

St Francois Assessor's Office
1 W Liberty
Farmington, MO 63640

Quotation Firm for 30 days
Terms: Net 30 days
Freight Included

Attn: County Commision
Phone 573-756-3623

LINE	QTY	PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	YOUR COST	EXT COST
1	4	Logitech M310 Wireless Mouse #LOG-910001675	33.00	132.00
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-
				-

Comments:

Account Manager
Teresa Johnson
tjohnson@inlandassoc.com
913-764-7977



PLEASE REMIT TO:
INLAND ASSOCIATES, INC.
1896 S W 158th Street
OLATHE, KS 66062



Date: 3.9.2021

Client Name: St. Francois County Assessor

Estimate#: 62309.1

#10 Standard window envelope with side seam

Finish Size: 9.5" x 4.125"

Stock: 24# with side seam with window

Ink: Black only; single sided

Finishing: NA

Price: Qty 19,000 - \$1,009.84 | \$0.05 per

Design: Not included in above pricing. Billed at \$25.00 per 15 minutes.

Additional Notes:

All orders are subject to a 10% over or underrun. Tax not included.

Thank You!



OGIO® Gravitate Full-Button Polo & OGIO® Ladies Gravitate Scoop 3/4-Sleeve



Why we ♥ them:

- Less formal but still professional.
- Moisture-wicking.
- Designed for movement.



Check with your representative for more details on the above tpc favorites.



Date: 3.8.2021

Client Name: St. Francois County Assessor

Estimate#: 62302.1

Assessor Affidavit

Finish Size: 7.5" x 4"

Stock: 20# 2 part reverse NCR

Ink: Black only; single sided

Finishing: Cutting

Price: Qty 5,000 - \$856.02 | \$0.17 per

Qty 10,000 - \$1,701.70 | \$0.17 per

Qty 15,000 - \$2,547.37 | \$0.169 per **BEST BUY!**

Design: Not included in above pricing. Billed at \$25.00 per 15 minutes.

Assessor Window Envelopes

Finish Size: 9.5" x 4.125"

Stock: 24# "A" Window Envelope

Ink: Black only; single sided

Finishing: Cutting

Price: Qty 2,500 - \$293.03 | \$0.12 per

Qty 3,000 - \$361.56 | \$0.12 per

Qty 4,500 - \$430.08 | \$0.10 per **BEST BUY!**

Design: Not included in above pricing. Billed at \$25.00 per 15 minutes.



Date: 3.8.2021

Client Name: St. Francois County Assessor

Estimate#: 62302.1

Assessor Regular Envelopes

Finish Size: 9.5" x 4.125"

Stock: Regular #10 Envelope

Ink: Black only; single sided

Price: Qty 2,500 - \$255.69 | \$0.10 per

Qty 3,500 - \$316.64 | \$0.09 per

Qty 4,500 - \$377.58 | \$0.08 per



Design: Not included in above pricing. Billed at \$25.00 per 15 minutes.

Additional Notes:

All orders are subject to a 10% over or underrun. Tax not included.

Thank You!



**OGIO® Gravitate Full-Button Polo &
OGIO® Ladies Gravitate Scoop 3/4-Sleeve**



Why we ♥ them:

- Less formal but still professional.
- Moisture-wicking.
- Designed for movement.



Check with your representative for more details on the above tpc favorites.