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Clay Copeland
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SINE S

John Gross

ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT

Office

BID — AGGREGATE

Bid Opening — March 9, 2021
(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

Company Name Base Rock Minerals

Contact Person
Dwayne Holst - sales

Address 6801 Votech Road
Contact Phone Number
Address Bonne Terre 573-579-1074-cell
City, State, Zip MO 63628 Contact Email
dwayneh@baserockminerals.com
QUARRY —573-358-1686
ITEM PRICE PER TON
Type 1 Base Gray (1” Minus) $6.30
Type 5 Base Brown (1” Minus) $6.15
2” Minus $6.25
3” Minus $6.25
4” Minus $6.25
3/8” Minus (Screenings) $3.30
Concrete Rock Sna
1” Clean $7.60
1%” Clean Sna
2” Clean $6.80
3" Clean $6.80
4” Clean $6.80
7” Clean $6.80
Shot Rock $S4.00
Rip Rap $9.50
Fill Rock $2.60
Grit (Granite) Sna
3/8"x1/4” (Granite) $na
6” Minus $4.75
1/4” Ice Control Trap Sna
1/8” Ice Control Trap $na
Manufactured Sand $4.25

*** Any additions that may apply may be added to this bid.**
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TY ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT

v\ :e: 1 West Liberty Street, Suite 301, Farmington, Missouri 63640
.-\ 'lepartment: 1640 East Woodlawn, Farmington, Missouri 63640

John Gross Office
e~/ t Highway Administrator PH (573) 431-4794
(573) 631-0603 FAX (573) 747-3014
jgross@sfcgov.org roadandbridge@sfcgov.org

BID — ASPHALT
Bid Opening —March 9, 2021

(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

Company Name Z_,Eﬁg_fjag;[ﬂmméo Contact Person
™
Address Fo Box 407 /5[2/40)/‘\12&
Address Contact Phone Number(s)
City, State, Zip [k MHitisn MO 63¢0] 573-431-(914-
BSPARRL R € X FAlHoo, Lo
ITEM PRICE PER TON
Commercial Cold Mix $ 5¢ 00
BP1 | sS4 5o
BP2 $4(.50
Bit Base S| S
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Administrater’s Office: 1 West Liberty Street, Suite 301, Farmington, Missouri 63640
Road and Bridge Department: 1540 East Woodlawn, Farmington, Missouri 63640

Clay Copeland John Gross Office
Highway Superintendent Highwaoy Administrator PH (573) 431-4794

(573) 315-6996 (573) 631-0603 FAX (573) 747-3014
ccopeland@sfcgov.org igross@sfcgov.org roadandbridge@sfcgov.org

BID — ASPHALT

Bid Opening — March 9, 2021

(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

Company Name Mineral Area Asphalt, LLC Contact Person

Address

Grant Jokerst (Sales) or Nicole Krodinger(Sal

7183 Raider Road Denny Halbert (Plant)

City, State, Zip

Bonne Terre, MO 63628 Grant: 314-623-5025

Denny: 314-640-1600
Nicole: 314-541-5258

ITEM PRICE PER TON
Commercial Cold Mix 5

BP1 $41.50

BP2 $42.50

Bit Base $41.50
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ASPHALT PLANT:

6801 Va-TECH RD

BONNE TERRE, MO &3628
573-330-0834

MINERAL AREA ASPHALT

OFFICE:

12132 STATE RD CC
P.O. Bax 637
FEsSTUSsS, MO 63028

PH: 636-937-7654
FAax: &636-937-8685

Project:

Date:
To:

QUOTATION

2021 Asphalt Prices
March 8, 2021

ATTN Clay Copeland / John Gross

St Francois County Road & Bridge Department
1640 East Woodlawn

Farmington, MO 63640

\_/
We are pleased to quote the following F.O.B. Bonne Terre Plant. '
Item No. Description Unit | Unit Price
1 Commercial Cold Mix TON $58.75
2 State Mix BP-1 TON $41.00
3 State Mix BP-2 TON $42.00
4 State Bit Base TON $40.75
5 Commercial Hot Mix TON $40.50

Thank you for your consideration.
If you have any questions, please call Grant Jokerst at (314) 623-5025 or (636) 937-7654.

A

-

Grant Jokerst, P.E.

Vice President - Sales
Mineral Area Asphalt

The above price is based on the current price for Liquid Asphalt. Due to asphalt volatility, the price may change if thlere is a significant price
change in liquid asphalt. We are willing to use an index similar to MoDOT's index adjustment for fuel and asphalt mix
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ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT

Administrator’s Office: 1 West Liberty Street, Suite 301, Farmington, Missourt 63640

Road and Bridge Department 1640 East Woodlawn, Farmington, Misscuri 63640

Clay Copeland John Gross Office
Highway Superintendent Highway Administrator PH {573} 431-4754
(573) 315-6996 {573) 631-0603 FAX (573) 747-3014

ccopeland@stcgov.org

roadandbridge@stcgov.org

BID — BATTERIES
Bid Opening — March 9, 2021

(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

OReflly AUIOMOIVE SIOTeS T

Company Name DRA-C'Reilly- Auto Parts Contact Person
Address 350 East Karsch Blvd. Ray Peralta

Address Contact Phone Number(s)
City, State, Zip Farmington, MO. 63640 (573) 701-0564

ITEM UNIT COST
H48/H6-60  920CA/780 CCA  Top Post SSB 48EXT $104.36
H65-60 1095 1045 CA/8725 850 CCA Top Post SSB 65EXT $102.05

H78 DT-60 1095 985 CA/&%5 800 CCA Top-Side Post SSB $99.28
34/78PRM

HP-315 3250 1170 CA/1808 950 CCA Top Post Stub SSB 31-5 | S107.75
40-XHD 1250 1290 CA/33606 1050 CCA Top Post (Grader $167.70

Battery) SSB 4D3

**price to include delivery to 1640 Woodlawn Dr. Farmington, MO 63640**

FOR COMPLETE PARTS
LOOK UP AND PRICING.
PLEASE VISIT Us AT
www. firstcallonline.com
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ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT
Administrator’s Office: 1 West Liberty Street, Suite 301, Farmington, Missouri 63640
Road and Bridge Department: 1640 East Woodlawn, Farmington, Missouri 63640

Clay Copeland John Gross Office
Highway Superintendent Highway Administrator PH (573)431-4794
(573) 315-6996 (573) 631-0603 FAX (573) 747-3014
ccopeland@sfcgov.org jgross@sfcgov.org roadandbridge@sfcgov.org
BID — CONCRETE

Bid Opening — March 9, 2021

(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

Company Name AAL Zociiaigis MATEEALS Contact Person
Address F o BoxX 2% PATEy Zon a NESRT
Address o2l peExy B Contact Phone Number(s)

City, State, Zip \MP=E AL MO G5z 573 - 22— 4400
CAL ~ ¥z 440D

ITEM (WITHOUT FIBERMESH) . PRICE PER YARD
5 bag mix F Ty s 77. 00
5.5 bag mix 7 /% ViR $ 85 =2
6 bag mix i 787 2. s o5 o0
MoDot Mix (8.5 bag mix) < 76/ 7/z,. s 04 oD
MoDot Mix (10 bag mix) g 7o [ 2. S |15 'Ui
Winter Service Charge $ o £
Hauling Charge E =20 "S
Calcium .05% $ | 4-,
Calcium 1% $ 2 ?1_7
Calcium 1.5% $ Ai i AL
Calcium 2% $ = %O
Commercial Fiber 24" x e, MONOEIAMENTTS e f"
FiNlel. SAND B 5



BID — CULVERT PIPE
Bid Opening — March 9, 2021

(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

Company Name __ Contech Engineered Contact Person
Solutions _ Mike Hill
Address ___ 140 Airport Industrial ‘/VK‘Q-P M@v
EIGIE Contact Phone Number(s)
Address 573-380-
Citv. State. 7in Sikeston Mo 63801 Nn719
GAUGE | ITEM PRICE PER FT
16 12” C.M.P. $12.50
16 15” C.M.P. $15.00
16 18” C.M.P. $18.75
16 24” C.M.P. $23.75
16 30” C.M.P. $30.00
16 36” C.M.P. $36.25
16 48” C.M.P. $47.50
14 36” C.M.P. $45.00
14 48" C.M.P. $60.00

12” HDPE - Soil Tight S n/A

15” HDPE - ST S

18” HDPE - ST S

24” HDPE - ST S

30” HDPE - ST S

36” HDPE - ST 'S

48" HDPE - ST s\

60” HDPE - ST N

12” HDPP - ST § W

SFC R&B ANNUAL CULVERT BID - PAGE 1
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PIESHLC HDPE
ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT

Administrator’s Office: 1 West Liberty Street, Suite 301, Farmington, Missouri 63640
Road and Bridge Department: 1640 East Woodlawn, Farmington, Missouri 63640

Clay Copeland John Gross Office
Highway Superintendent Highway Administrator PH {573) 431-47%4

{573) 315-6996 (573) 631-0603 FAX (573) 747-3014
ccopeland@sfcgov.org jgross@sfcgov.org roadandbridge@sfcgov.org

BID — CULVERT PIPE
Bid Opening —March 9, 2021
(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

Company Name: Waterwork Specialties, Inc. Contact Person
Address: | 7801 Berry Road Aaron Carrow
Address Contact Phone Number(s)
City, State, Zip: Bonne Terre, MO 63628 Office: 573.358.1826
Fax: 573.358.7304

GAUGE | ITEM PRICE PER
FT
16 12” C.M.P. $No Bid
16 15” C.M.P. $ No Bid
16 18” C.M.P. $ No Bid
16 24" C.M.P. $ No Bid
16 30” C.M.P. $ No Bid
16 36” C.M.P. $ No Bid
16 48” C.M.P. $ No Bid
14 36" C.M.P. $ No Bid
14 48" C.M.P, $ No Bid
12” HDPE - Soil Tight $5.89
15” HDPE - ST $8.20
18” HDPE - ST $11.25
24” HDPE - ST $17.95 \
30” HDPE - ST $26.07 |
36” HDPE - ST $32.84
48” HDPE - ST $56.22
60” HDPE - ST $89.42

SFC R&B ANNUAL CULVERT BID - PAGE 1



Clay Copeland
Highway Supermtendent
(573) 315-6996

seapeland’@slcgon . org

~"ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY RO

Administrator's Office: 1 West Liberty Street. Sutte 301, Farmington. Missouri 63640
Road and Bridge Department: 1640 Last Woodlawn. Farmmgton. Missourt 63640
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John Gross
Highwen Administrator
(5733 631-0603

Jerossid sfezson vie

R -

AD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT

Office
PH (573)431-4794
FAX (373) 747-3014
roadandbridge@ sfegov.org

D

BID - FLEET ENGINE OIL, HYDRAULIC OIL, LUBRICANT

Bid Opening — March 9, 2021

Contact Person
en *‘ S&\ E

Contact Phone Number(s)
512 25¢- 230%

(Please use this form for your bid to be

PRICE PER TOTAL

/Galion $ é,‘l‘? Gfé[}m/
/Gallon $ 7. 75 GQ’LLOA/
$3.5¢ duner
[Gallon $ St ? GoA-Llow”
$ £2.52 Gunet
$ ?;75:& Cateon
$ /94.5%
$210. &8
$2.95 Tube
$ /09 75
$ QTS (AL
$ 3.5¢ gaAreT
$ 725 Crason
g /127 72
$ 343.75
Joaim$ BLTE GAation/

Company Name
Sanmne &\ C:M%&»’\H

Address [2¢ aze! Oc

Address 857 FeossAve. St

City, State, Zip Sikkeston, Mo b2€ON

considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

ITEM QUANTITY
15w40 Fleet Oil (High Mileage) Bulk(=50 Gallon)
CI-4 Plus Spec (4) — 1 Gallon
CI-4 Plus Spec (12) — 1 Quart
Universal Hydraulic Fluid Bulk(>100 Gallon)
ATF D/M (12) = 1 Quart
Syn ATF AT (4) - 1 Gallon
HD 80w90 (1)- 120 Keg
HXP 222 Lube (1)-121.2 Keg
HXP 222 Lube Tubes
Syn Gear 75/90 (1) — 38 Pail
CJ4 15w40 (4) — 1 Gallon
CJ-4 15w40 (12) — 1 Quart
CJ-4 15w40 (1) -5 Gal Drum
DEF Fluid 55 Gal Drum
Kerosene 55 Gal Drum
10w-30 Synthetic Bulk(>50 Gallon)
10w-30 Synthetic (1) Quart

Antifreeze — Full Strgth Universal Bulk(>40 Gallon)

Windshield Washer Fluid -20°

Bulk(>40 Gallon)

$ 239 Buae
/Gallon Q,.(.Z. @-L(O/\/
fowen$ [, 8T GALton/
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ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT
Administrator’s Office. 1 West Liberty Street, Suite 301, Farmington, Missouri 63640
Road and Brigge Department. 1640 tast Wocedlawn, Farmington, Missouri 63640
Clay Copeland John Gross Office
Highway Superintendent Highway Administrator PH (573)431-4794
(573) 315-6996 (573) 631-0603 FAX (573) 747-3014
ccopeland@sfcgov.org jgross@sfcgov.org roadandbridge@sfcgov.org

BID — ROAD OILS

Bid Opening —March 9, 2021

(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

Company Name: Missouri Petroleum Products Co. Contact Person
Address Mike Hartman
Address 1620 Woodson Rd Contact Phone Number(s)
City, State, Zip St. Louis, MO 63114 314-219-7319

ITEM QUANTITY PRICE PER GALLON
CRS2P Up to 5,000 $2.75

CRS2 Dura-patch Up to 5,000 $2.55

SS1H/CSS1H Up to 10,000 $2.60

MC-30 Up to 10,000 $3.40

MC-800 Up to 1,500 53.35

*Pricing based on FOB-Missouri Petroleum and/or Bi-State Emulsions - St Louis, MO



ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT

Administrator’s Office: 1 West Liberty Street, Suite 301, Farmington, Missouri 63640
Road and Bridge Department: 1640 East Woodlawn, Farmington, Missouri 63640

Clay Copeland John Gross Office
Highway Superintendent Highway Administrator PH (573) 431-4794
(573) 315-6956 - (573) 631-0603 FAX (573) 747-3014
ccopeland@sfcgov.org igross@sfcgov.org roadandbridge@sfcgov.org
BID — SALT

Bid Opening — March 9, 2021

(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

Company Name Bevie oaklsy , e Contact Person

Address i AdGEL(C4 ST BicH Corgm oS
Address Contact Phone Number(s)

City, State, Zip =1 Lod(s, Flo (036\-(7 3’1‘——[—98[’«4090
ITEM PRICE PER TON

Ice Control Road Salt S 12. = / To~t DEL,

To be ordered and paid for on an “as needed” basis throughout the duration of the annual bid
period.

Product to be delivered within a 72 hour period once ordered.

Product will be ordered in, at least, 50 ton increments.
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ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGE DEPARTMENT

Administrator’s Office: 1 West Liberty Street, Suite 301, Farmington, Missouri 63640
Road and Bridge Department: 1640 East Woodlawn, Farmington, Missouri 63640

Clay Copeland lohn Gross Office
Highway Superintendent Highway Administrator PH (573) 431-4794
(573) 315-6996 {573) 631-0603 FAX (573) 747-3014
ccopeland@sfcgov.org igross@sfcgov.org roadandbridge@sfcgov.org
BID — SIGNS

Bid Opening — March 9, 2021

(Please use this form for your bid to be considered. Additional sheets may be attached)

Company Name Gi< C S N % PP Contact Person

Address P.O. BQAUQ.L 4484 /’50[0( /‘ézm"eQS
Address £ 5 Contact Phone Number(s)
City, state, zip  lwood TR 38330 5T - 450 - 4386

Home OFfice |9oe - 223 BSGH

ITEM UNIT COST TOTAL

Category 3 Signs — Warning, Yellow 24"x24”" S &OQS $ DO 3
Category 3 Signs — Warning, Yellow 30”x30" S QCI."O S ch 0
Category 3 Signs — School Bus Stop Ahead, Green 30”x30” s Jj2 e S qg 25
Category 3 Signs — Slow Children, Green 18"x24” $ 09 1S S DG ! 3
Category 3 Signs — Regulatory, Weight Limit 24”x30” $ 23.499 |5 3uste
Category 3 Signs — Regulatory, Speed Limit 18”x24” $ 16 S =} s

Category 3 Signs — Regulatory, Speed Limit 24”x30” G 15 2G.1S

Posts — U Channel, Galvanized, 2lbs per ft, 10’ length $ 135 |S De3S
Posts — Surface Mount Channelizer, Tubular Mark, Orange, 28" S S

’ O %~ :
tall with 3-3” orange reflective rings and black base pins o?q .Q c% -
Posts — Surface Mount Channelizer, Tubular Mark, Orange, 42” S 5 S -

. ' T S0
tall with 3-3” orange reflective rings and black base pins 33 5 33 _
High Intensity Street Sign 6”x18” Double Sided $ (%S $ .23
High Intensity Street Sign 6”x24" Double Sided $ J0.'S |$ 0.1

[Type here]
SFC R&B SIGNS ANNUAL BID —PAGE 1




