

MINDY WOOLBRIDGE
DEPUTY ASSESSOR

EDDIE MAHURAN, DIRECTOR
REAL ESTATE DEPT



WENDY KELLER, DIRECTOR
PERSONAL PROPERTY DEPT

JANE RASNIC
REAL ESTATE APPRAISER SUPERVISOR

DAN WARD

ASSESSOR OF ST. FRANCOIS COUNTY
1 WEST LIBERTY OFFICE 200
FARMINGTON, MISSOURI 63640
(573) 756-1878
FAX NO. (573) 756-5687
E-MAIL: assessor@sfcgov.org
WEBSITE: www.sfcgov.org

M.A.O.S.

TO: Kevin Engler, County Clerk
FROM: Dan Ward, Assessor
DATE: January 12, 2021
SUBJECT: Annual Bid

*M.A.O.S.
Jamie Gammeter*

The following is a list of supplies requested to be included in the 2021 annual bid for the Assessor's Office:

ITEMS COST	AMOUNT	TOTAL
Post It Notes, 1 7/8" x 1 7/8" (Plain, Yellow) MMM-622-10SSCY	5 bxs. of 10 ea.	<u>5.64 PK</u> 28.20
Post It Notes, 3 x 3 (Plain, Yellow) MMM-654-YW	10 bxs. of 12 ea.	<u>11.66 PK</u> 116.60
Post It Notes, 4 x 6 (Plain, Yellow) MMM-659-YW	5 bxs of 12 ea.	<u>24.61 PK</u> 123.05
Uniball Signo 207 (Red) Ink Pens UBC-33952	4 bxs. of 12 ea.	<u>10.81 DZ</u> 43.24
Uniball Signo 207 (Black) Ink Pens UBC-33590	4 bxs. of 12 ea.	<u>10.86 DZ</u> 43.44
Papermate Flexgrip Ultra (Med Blue) Ink Pens PAP-9610131	1 bx. of 12 ea.	<u>11.22 DZ</u> 11.22
Sharpie Fine tip Permanent Marker SAN-30001 Black	1 bx. of 12 ea.	<u>8.24 DZ</u> 8.24
Bic Intensity Pro Permanent Marker Pro Bullet Tip Bic-PMIPK11BK	1 pkg. of 12 ea.	<u>15.61 DZ</u> 15.61

Harold Callahan

Rubber Bands #33 UNV 00133	2 (1 lb) Bags	<u>3.99 PK</u>	7.98
Sort Kwik Lee-10132	1 pkg. of 2 ea.	<u>4.05 PK</u>	4.05
Binder Clips (Med) UNV-10210VP Black	2 pkg. 36 ea.	<u>1.85 PK</u>	3.70
Correction Tape Mono Hybrid TOM-68721 Side-Action Applicator	1 pkg. 10 ea.	<u>14.50 PK</u>	14.50
Air Duster II Power Duster PDC-105870	1 pkg. 6 ea.	<u>27.91 PK</u>	27.91
Clorox Disinfecting Wipes RAC-89346CT Crisp Linen Scent RAC 99716CT flat packs lemon/lime (6pk/ct)	2 pkgs. 6 ea.	<u>29.17 CT</u>	58.34
Rhodia Classic Bound Graph Paper 5 x 5 80 Sheets per pad	12 ea.	<u>11.49 ea</u>	11.49
Important Message Pads – Universal Pink Pads UNV-48023	1 doz. Pads	<u>1.86 DZ</u>	1.86
Calendar Refill – Jan – Dec 6 x 6 2022 AAG-K1-50	1 ea.	<u>NO BID</u>	
Tape Measure - Ace 100 ft. 1/2 Width Crank Style	4 ea.	<u>NO BID</u>	
Tape Measure – Fat Max 25 ft. SQN 33730 30 ft	4 ea.	<u>32.17 ea</u>	128.68
Gel Crystals Wrist Support Mouse Pad FEL-9112101	2 ea.	<u>12.84 ea</u>	25.68
Logitech M310 Wireless Mouse LOG-910001675	4 ea.	<u>31.19 ea</u>	124.76
Mobil Power Inverter 150W with Input Voltage 12V DC Output Voltage 12V AC Continuous Power 150W	3 ea.	<u>NO BID</u>	
Microsoft 65 W Power Supply Adapter for Surface Pro 4 85" Cord Black	3 ea.	<u>NO BID</u>	
Lorell Executive Mid Back Work Chair Mesh Back – Fabric Seat AIE EL 42BME10B	9 ea. see attached	<u>135.00 ea</u>	1215.00
Crio Big & Tall Mid-Back Task Chair (Black) BSX-VL585ES10T	1 ea.	<u>312.00 ea</u>	312.00

Board of Equalization Window Envelopes	38 bxs. at 500 ea.	_____	
Assessor Affidavit – Non-Assessment	5,000 ea.	_____	
Eric Dugal Letterhead	500 ea.	_____	
Eric Dugal Envelopes (Blue Ink & Raised Print)	500 ea.	_____	
Eric Dugal Window Envelopes	5 bxs. at 500 ea.	_____	
Eric Dugal Envelopes (Black Print)	5 bxs. at 500 ea.	_____	
ICX Paper, Wide Format, 36 x 3 ICX 90750219	2 Rolls	<u>45.52RL</u>	91.04

HP 57 Tri Color (For HP Office Jet 4215)	2 ea.	_____
HP 35A Toner (For HP LaserJet P1006)	1 ea.	_____
Konica Minolta Toner TN513 A33K031	1 ea.	_____
Cannon Ink for Plotter:		
CNM PFI-320 MBK	2 ea.	_____
CNM PFI-320 BK	2 ea.	_____
CNM PFI-320 C	2 ea.	_____
CNM PFI-320 M	2 ea.	_____
CNM PFI-320 Y	2 ea.	_____

Total Bid Amount: \$ 3,996.59

Company Name Mineral Area Office Supply

Contact Person Jamie Gammon

Address 331 W. Main St.

Park Hills, Mo 63601

Telephone 431-4777

M.A.O.S. Printing M.A.O.S. Printing

Board of Equalization Window Envelopes	38 bxs. at 500 ea. (20,000)	<u>770.00</u>
Assessor Affidavit – Non-Assessment	5,000 ea.	<u>289.00</u>
Eric Dugal Letterhead	500 ea.	<u>145.00</u>
Eric Dugal Envelopes (Blue Ink & Raised Print)	500 ea.	<u>69.00 (Flat Print)</u> <u>No BID (Raised Print)</u>
Eric Dugal Window Envelopes	5 bxs. at 500 ea.	<u>165.00</u>
Eric Dugal Envelopes (Black Print)	5 bxs. at 500 ea.	<u>142.00</u>
ICX Paper, Wide Format, 36 x 3	2 Rolls	<u> </u>